
This article was first published on Marc Clifton’s blog on 11/15/2012.  
Link 

What follows is a paper that last year I commissioned Peter Buckbee to 
write, looking at social finance models from the perspective of Steiner’s 
threefold social model.  Additional editorial contributions were made by 
Hillary Corsun.  I’m finally getting around to posting his paper 
here.  Enjoy! 

Social Finance 
In its essence Social Finance, or Socially Responsible Investing, is about 
making investments that provide not just a financial benefit but also a 
social and environmental one. This is often referred to as looking out for 
the ‘Triple Bottom Line’ of People, Planet, and Profit. Investors can affect 
the Triple Bottom Line by choosing to invest in projects that are directly 
aligned with it, by choosing to screen out any investment from their 
portfolio that may be harming people or the planet, or by using their 
power as shareholders to advocate for social and environmental policies 
within a given corporation. 

Generally people think of the Stock Market when they think of investing, 
but Socially Responsible Investing often operates outside of the Stock 
Market, relying on independent for-profit and nonprofit institutions to 
make investments, loans, and gifts that yield a Triple Bottom Line. This 
document investigates some of these institutions and the various 
financial vehicles they employ including: 

1. Microfinance 

2. Socially Responsible Loan Programs 

3. Investment Clubs and Impact Investing Networks 

4. Program-Related Investment 

5. Social Impact Bonds 

6. Community Development Investment 

7. Grantmaking and Donor Advised Funds 

8. Crowdfunding 
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The organizations that use these vehicles run the gamut from a loose 
network of investors and businesses to big banks with billions of dollars 
in assets.  Any one organization may use a combination of practices. For 
example, Alternatives Federal Credit Union (AFCU) is a 
Community Development Investment Institution based in Ithaca, NY, 
that offers Microloans and Program Related Investments among other 
usual banking services.  AFCU also receives Grants, Community 
Development Investment funds from the government, and Program 
Related Investments. 

This document provides a brief definition of each of these eight Social 
Finance vehicles and then explores a number of examples – organized on 
a spectrum from diffuse networks, to platforms, to clubs, to partnerships, 
to single institutions – which include: 

1. Local Investment Opportunities Network (LION) 

2. Kickstarter 

3. No Small Potatoes Investment Club 

4. Kiva 

5. Create Jobs for USA 

6. Carrot Project 

7. Social Finance US 

8. La Mantanita Fund 

9. Alternatives Federal Credit Union 

10. RSF Social Finance 

For each example, this document addresses: 

1. Type of organization 

2. Financial vehicle used 

3. Type of funding offered and received 

4. Minimum or maximum levels of investment 

5. Who takes the risk and how risky is it 

6. Whether or not collateral is required and, if so, who provides it 



7. From which sphere(s) of society (economic, political/rights, or 
cultural) does funding originate and where does it go (for an 
explanation see Three Spheres of Society, P. Buckbee, at the 
end of this document) 

8. How the money flows 

Definitions 
Microfinance 

Microfinance is the practice of providing small loans, credit, and other 
financial services to people who otherwise lack access to such services 
due to low income level, limited credit history, or remote location, for 
instance. Services are generally offered to promote entrepreneurship and 
economic independence with the belief that, if given access to capital, 
poor people can raise themselves out of poverty. Organizations such 
as Kiva achieve this through securing many small loans from people all 
around the world, and working with field partners and volunteers in poor 
regions to match investors with borrowers.  Other microfinance 
organizations may focus more narrowly on a given sector or region. The 
Carrot Project, for instance, focuses on creating financing opportunities 
for small-scale, sustainable food production in the Northeast U.S. 

Examples: Kiva, Alternatives Federal Credit Union, Create Jobs for 
USA, Carrot Project 

 Socially Responsible Loan Programs 

Loan programs can exist as an independent entity or as a part of a larger 
financial institution. Socially Responsible Loan programs differ from 
conventional ones in that they are mission-aligned and serve the Triple 
Bottom Line in some way. While microfinance tends to emphasize small 
loans to low-income communities, Socially Responsible Loan programs 
may offer more conventionally-sized loans to a broader contingency 
within the parameters of Social Finance. 

Examples: Carrot Project; RSF Social Finance, No Small Potatoes 
Investment Club, La Mantanita Fund 



 Investment Clubs and Impact Investing Networks 

Investment Clubs and Impact Investing Networks are a very direct flavor 
of Social Finance. The Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) 
defines Investment Clubs as “a group of people who pool their money to 
make investments.” Investment clubs are not regulated and do not have 
to register as an Investment Corporation if ‘Interests’ (investments) in 
the club aren’t considered securities, or if they have an exemption such 
as “non-public offering” status. Interests aren’t considered securities as 
long as every member of the club plays an active role in decision-making. 

Clubs such as the No Small Potatoes Investment Club in Maine 
focus on Loans to small businesses, while others may choose to make 
equity investments or partake in some other form of investment. 
Investment clubs typically file as partnerships or LLC’s. Impact Investing 
Networks may be as simple as an email list of potential investors and 
businesses and a quarterly meeting, like the Washington State-
based Local Investment Opportunities Network (LION), or may 
be a more structured nonprofit which partners with other foundations, 
family offices, and investors. 

 Examples: Local Opportunities Network (LION), No Small Potatoes 
Investment Club 

 Program Related Investment (PRI) 

Program Related Investment (PRI) is the practice of providing equity 
investments, loans, or loan guarantees at lower-than-market rates to 
mission-aligned projects with a charitable purpose. Given the expected 
return of principal, at minimum, and interest, in many cases, 
foundations may designate a portion of their assets or grant budget to 
PRI as a way to recycle capital to charitable projects. PRI allows 
foundations to provide such projects with larger amounts of capital than 
a typical grant size. The largest sectors funded by PRI include Education, 
Affordable Housing, Economic and Community Development, and the 
Environment (Source: Foundation Center, 2010, “Doing Good with 
Foundation Assets”). 

Examples: RSF Social Finance 



Community Development Investment (CDI) 

Community Development Investment (CDI) is a catch-all term within 
Social Finance for practices that focus especially on the “People” aspect 
of the Triple Bottom Line. Like Microfinance, CDI targets low-income 
communities and addresses such issues as affordable housing, job 
creation, education, and small business development. Common vehicles 
for CDI include Community Development Financial Institutions (CDFI), 
Community Development Credit Unions, Community Development 
Corporations, and Community Loan Funds. These are usually nonprofit 
organizations that offer financial services such as loans, bonds, and 
public and private equity, as well as education and consulting to the 
specific underserved communities they are embedded in. Funds are 
often matched by the Federal Government’s CDFI Fund. 

Examples: Alternatives Federal Credit Union, Create Jobs for USA, 
Carrot Project 

 Social Impact Bonds (SIB) 

A Social Impact Bond (SIB) is a kind of contract between private 
investors, government, and nonprofits. Investors provide funding to 
nonprofits who in-turn provide preventative solutions to social problems 
like drug addiction and juvenile delinquency, which might otherwise 
escalate and place demands on federally-funded social programs and the 
justice system. If the agreed-upon outcome is achieved, as assessed by a 
third party, then the government reimburses investors with interest or 
performance bonuses. If the outcomes are not achieved, the investment 
becomes a donation to the nonprofit and the investors receive no 
financial return. 

In other words, when an SIB successfully meets its goal, government sees 
improved social outcomes at a reduced public expense, investors see a 
social and financial return, nonprofits obtain a revenue stream, citizens 
see safer, healthier communities, and the individuals served by the 
nonprofits receive help getting their lives on track. 

Examples: Social Finance US 

Grantmaking and Donor Advised Funds 



Many Social Finance organizations include Grantmaking (the offering of 
grants) in their repertoire. Grants are most often made to mission-
aligned nonprofit organizations but may also be made to socially 
responsible businesses, educational institutions, or individuals. While 
Grantmaking does not see the direct financial returns that loan and 
equity investments do, Grantmaking does provide tax-deductions and 
sought-for social or environmental outcomes. Grantmaking can also help 
an institution or program become profitable in the long run. Grants have 
to be applied for and recipients usually must write a report upon 
completion of the funded project demonstrating they met the intended 
outcomes. 

Donor Advised Funds are an intermediary between direct philanthropic 
gifts or pledges and formal Grantmaking. Donors (families, individuals, 
or organizations) place funds into an institution with a Donor Advised 
Fund program and advise that institution as to how they want their 
money used. Organizations or individuals can then apply to the Donor 
Advised Fund to receive grants or donations. The Institution does the 
administrative work and provides the opportunity for a tax deduction. In 
turn, the institution has access to capital that can be invested for a 
return. While Donor Advised Funds allow donors to make 
recommendations as to what they want their money to be used for, 
institutions overseeing the funds have full control of the capital once 
donated and are not obligated to follow the recommendation. 

Examples: RSF Social Finance 

Crowdfunding 

Crowdfunding is another way to make donations. As the name implies, it 
relies on many small donations from friends and supporters to help fund 
things like artistic projects, citizen journalism or disaster relief. Web 
platforms like Kickstarter and online social networking sites like 
Facebook are instrumental in this type of funding. 

Examples: Kickstarter 

Examples 



Local Investment Opportunities Network 

(LION) 

 

Narrative: The Local Investment Opportunities Network (LION) 
started in Port Townsend, Washington. There is no legal entity; it is 
simply a network of individual investors interested in investing in locally 
operated and locally owned businesses looking for funding. There is, 
however, an application process to become a member in which the 
applicant outlines his/her profile and the opportunities he/she is looking 
for and completes a confidentiality agreement. Members have access to 
an email list of interested parties as well as community social events and 
quarterly meetings.  LION provides some standard investment 
agreement templates but does not offer legal or financial advice. 
Investors and borrowers can choose to involve their own lawyers or 
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financial advisors. Interest rates and other terms of investment are set 
for each investment opportunity between parties involved. It is standard 
for borrowers to provide investors with a business plan. 

Type of Organization: Informal Network 

Financial Vehicle(s): Impact Investment Network 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt, Equity 

Type of Funding Received: Debt, Equity 

Minimum Investment: $10,000 

Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: Per investment, investors take the risk 

Collateral: Per investment 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic 

Money Flow: Investors make loans or purchase equity shares in local 
businesses and get aid back on the terms they set with the borrower. 

Kickstarter 



 

Narrative: Kickstarter is a New York City-based online fundraising 
platform to support creative projects in the fields of film, music, 
journalism, technology, food, etc. Projects funded through Kickstarter 
rely on Crowdfunding, which takes the form of small donations from 
friends and supporters. Donors receive a ‘reward’ in return for their 
donation, which generally comes out of the project itself. For instance, a 
reward could be a copy of the music cd or comic book created, or a ticket 
to a dance performance. 

Projects have to have clearly defined goals and expectations and a 
creative purpose. Charities cannot apply. Individuals and organizations 
can post their project on the Kickstarter website to solicit donations. The 
amount of money needed to complete the project and the timeframe for 
completion must be specified. If the project doesn’t achieve its 
fundraising goal it doesn’t receive any funding.  There is no fee for 
posting a project. Kickstarter only charges a fee if the project successfully 
reaches its fundraising goals. 
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Type of Organization: For-profit corporation                 

Financial Vehicle(s): Crowdfunding 

Type of Funding Offered: Donations, ‘Rewards’ 

Type of Funding Received: Fees 

Minimum Investment: None 

Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: Donors take on the risk 

Collateral: None 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Cultural 

Money Flow: Individuals make donations online towards creative 
projects. If the project successfully raises the amount of money specified 
within the timeframe specified by the project creator, the donor’s credit 
card will be deducted, Kickstarter will charged a 5% fee, and Amazon will 
charge an additional 3-5% credit card processing fee. 

No Small Potatoes Investment Club 



 

Narrative: No Small Potatoes Investment Club incorporated in Maine 
in the spring of 2011. The club makes low-interest loans to Maine-based 
food businesses and farms. There are two basic requirements to join the 
club: A minimum initial investment of $5000 and active participation in 
investment decisions upon joining. One does not have to be a certified 
investor to join the club. Active participation from all members makes it 
so the club does not have to register its investments with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission. 

Type of Organization: LLC 

Financial Vehicle(s): Investment Club, Loan Program 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt 

Type of Funding Received: Equity 

Minimum Investment: $5,000 
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Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: LLC takes the risk. Risk level depends on given 

investment opportunity 

Collateral: Unknown 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic 

Money Flow: Investors buy into the club. The pooled investments are 
used to make low-interest loans to Maine-based food businesses and 
farmers. Farmers pay back loans with interest. 

Kiva 
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Narrative: Kiva is a non-profit organization out of San Francisco, 
California. Kiva’s goal is to help alleviate poverty. On its website, the 
organization highlights lending opportunities to underserved individuals 
all around the world. The average loan size for the recipient is about 
$400. Loans are given for agriculture, housing, and small business 
development. Loans are sometimes pooled to make them more 
substantial and also distributed as a ‘pool’ to be divided amongst a group 
of people. There is no return for the lender. Loan recipients are charged 
interest to cover the costs of the loan. 100% percent of the lender’s 
money goes to the borrower. Kiva partners with independent, pre-
existing microfinance institutions called ‘field partners’ which are firmly 
established in the borrower’s community. Field partners help to match 
lenders with a best-fit loan opportunity. Kiva is funded by grants, 
donations and corporate sponsorship. 

Type of Organization: Nonprofit online platform 

Financial Vehicle(s): Microfinance 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt 

Type of Funding Received: Grants, donations, corporate sponsorship 

Minimum Investment: $25 

Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: Risk levels vary depending on recipient. Kiva rates risk for each 
loan opportunity. While microloans are often considered risky, Kiva has 
a 98% pay back history. Lenders take on the risk. Field partners pursue 
collections procedures in case of loan default 

Collateral: Unknown 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic, 

Political/Rights 



Money Flow: Lenders make a no-interest loan to Kiva from anywhere 
in the world; kiva gives a no-interest loan to a field partner in the 
community of the specified borrower; field partners provide a loan with 
interest (to cover their costs) to an individual borrower or group of 
borrowers; borrowers repay field partners; field partners repay kiva; kiva 
repays lenders. Kiva covers its own costs from public and private grants, 
donations and corporate sponsorship. 

Create Jobs for USA 

 

Narrative: Create Jobs for USA is a brand new program initiated by 
Starbucks’ Chief Executive, Howard Shultz. Create Jobs for USA is a 
partnership between Starbucks and Opportunity Finance Network 
(OFN). Starbucks will pay for marketing and operating costs of the 
program, as well as make a $5 million donation for seed funding.  Once 
the program is up and running, it will depend on small donations from 
Starbucks customers and individual online donations. Donations become 
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equity for Community Development Financial Institutions, which can 
leverage the equity 7:1 and make loans to underserved communities in 
the U.S..  Donors receive a patriotic bracelet in exchange. 

Type of Organization: Corporate and CDFI Partnership 

Financial Vehicle(s): Community Development, Investment, 
Microfinance 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt, Equity 

Type of Funding Received: Grants, Donations, CDFI funds 

Minimum Investment: $5 

Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: Donors, CDFI’s 

Collateral: Businesses provide collateral on the terms of the particular 
CDFI they are working with 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Money Flow: Individuals make a donation either at Starbucks or 
online. The donation goes to a fund at Opportunity Finance Network 
(OFN), which is a network of CDFI’s. Donations become equity for 
CDFI’s, which can be leveraged 7:1. Government matches investments 
from CDFI Fund.  CDFI’s make loans to underserved communities for 
small business development, job creation, housing, or banking services. 
Borrowers pay back the CDFI. 

Carrot Project 



 

Narrative: The Carrot Project, based in Somerville, Massachusetts, 
partners with other nonprofits and Community Development Financial 
Institutions to create regional financing programs as well as business 
and technical support for small and mid-sized farmers and food-related 
businesses, to collaborate on innovative agricultural research, and to 
provide investment opportunities in sustainable agriculture. They offer 
four loan programs in Maine, Massachusetts and Vermont geared 
towards providing farmers and food-related businesses with start-up 
capital, working capital or funding for capital improvements. Loans vary 
in size from $3,000 to $75,000, typically have a 7% interest rate, and 1 to 
7 year terms. 

Type of Organization: Nonprofit 

Financial Vehicle(s): Microfinance, Loan Program 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt 
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Type of Funding Received: Donations, CDFI funds, Debt 

Minimum Investment: $3,000 

Maximum Investment: $75,000 

Risk: Investors, Carrot Project, partner organizations assume the risk 

Collateral: In some cases, the Carrot Project will collateralize loans 
from Partner Organizations; farmers and food businesses provide 
collateral on capital loans to partner organizations 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic 

Money Flow: Carrot Project receives donations and investments; then 
provides capital or 

collateral to a partner organization. Partner organizations may match 
Carrot Project investments with CDFI or private funds, or leverage them 
to make loans. to farmers and food businesses, who, in-turn, pay back 
the partner organization, who then pays back the Carrot Project. 

Social Finance US 



 

Narrative: Nonprofit organizations like Social Finance US, based in 
Boston, MA, are ‘blazing the trail’ in the U.S. for Social Impact Bonds 
(more common in England), and consequently have taken on a 
comprehensive strategy to advocate for SIB’s. SIB’s must first be 
legislated by the state or federal government so Social Finance US 
lobbies government. They also find investors to provide initial capital, 
identify and council nonprofits that can provide the social service, 
structure terms of the SIB, provide management and oversight of the SIB 
for the nonprofit, and hire third-parties to assess outcomes. 

Type of Organization: Nonprofit 

Financial Vehicle(s): Social Impact Bonds 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt, Grants 

Type of Funding Received: Debt, Equity, Grants 
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Minimum Investment: Unknown 

Maximum Investment: Unknown 

Risk: Investors assume the risk 

Collateral: None 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Political/Rights 

Money Flow: Investors place funds in a Social Impact Bond, 
administered by Social Finance US.  Funding goes to a nonprofit that, in-
turn provides a preventative social service. If the nonprofit successfully 
achieves expected outcomes, the Government compensates investors 
with interest or performance bonuses. 

La Mantanita Fund 



 

Narrative:  La Mantanita Fund (LaM FUND) is a program of La 
Mantanita Co-op, a food co-op based in Albuquerque, New Mexico. The 
fund was created to provide “pre-payment” for product loans to farmers 
and food producers who sell their products at the co-op. In the last year 
the Fund expanded by selling “interests” (shares). Interests were set at 
$250 each. 400 units were issued in total – 100 A-Interests and 300 B-
Interests. The Co-op bought all 100 A-interests in order to cover any 
outstanding balances in the event of loan default. This way the coop also 
showed their support for the program and lessened the risk for other 
investors. B-interests were made available on a “first come first serve” 
basis to co-op members living in the state of New Mexico. In order to 
keep the grassroots nature of the Fund, a peak on investment was set at 
$10,000 per individual. Any Income generated by the Fund is divided in 
proportion to number of shares. Payment on investments is approved by 
a vote of the Co-op Board of Directors, in a similar manner as annual 
membership patronage refunds get approved. Interests have a one year 
term. 
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Type of Organization: Program of La Mantanita Co-op, a Consumer 
Cooperative 

Financial Vehicle(s):  Loan Program 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt 

Type of Funding Received: Equity 

Minimum investment: $250 

Maximum investment: $10,000 

Risk: High.  Investors take risk 

Collateral:  Equity investments (“interests”) are used as collateral for 
loans 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic 

 Money Flows: Co-op members buy interests.  Funds are placed in a 
money market account at the New Mexico Educators Federal Credit 
Union and held as collateral for loans.  Loans are decided upon by the La 
Mantanita Fund loan advisory committee, and administered by the 
credit union.  Loan recipients pay back the credit union with interest 

Alternatives Federal Credit Union 



 

Narrative: Alternatives Federal Credit Union, out of Ithaca, New York, 
is a Community Development Credit Union (CDCU). CDCU’s are set up 
to serve low-income and minority communities with imperfect, limited, 
or no credit background. Like conventional Credit Unions, they are 
nonprofit, tax-exempt, government regulated and insured, and 
cooperatively-owned and governed. CDCU’s provide loans, savings, 
affordable banking, and products and services to help members free 
themselves from high-cost, predatory debt. They also offer financial 
education and counseling to their members and community. 

Community Development Credit Unions are a particular kind of 
Community Development Financial Institution (CDFI). CDFI’s serve a 
variety of needs, including job creation, business and commercial real 
estate development, affordable housing, and basic financial services to 
underserved communities. An organization meeting such a need can 
apply for CDFI certification from the U.S. Department of Treasury’s 
CDFI Fund. The fund provides CDFI’s with monetary awards (at least a 
1:1 match on private investments) and tax credits. As a private-sector 
organization, each CDFI takes a unique approach to the issues. 
Alternatives has a number of innovative financial and educational 
services. For example, they have a Community Partnership Lending 
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program for clients of partner nonprofits where the nonprofits raise 
funds and deposit them at Alternatives, then Alternatives will lend 
double that amount to the clients of that nonprofit. 

Type of Organization: Community Development Credit Union 
(CDCU) 

Financial Vehicle(s): Community Development Investment, 
Microfinance 

Type of Funding Offered: Microloans, subsidized loans, loan 
guarantees, equity investments, savings, line of credit, bonds 

Type of Funding Received: Deposits, grants, donations, loans, CDFI 
funds 

Minimum Investment: Minimum one-time $20 membership fee plus 
$5 deposit. 

Maximum Investment: $50,000 (business loan) 

Risk: Depositors risk is low as Alternatives is NCUA insured.  The Credit 
Union’s risk varies depending on the financial product they are offering. 
Microloans are generally considered high-risk to the investor, though in 
reality high payback rates are common. Government Bonds are low risk. 

Collateral: Alternatives offers several different kinds of loans and loan 
guarantees, each with unique collateral demands.  In all cases the 
borrower is responsible for providing collateral. 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights and 
Cultural 

Money Flow: Funds come from member equity and deposits, non-
member deposits, private and government grants and investments, and 
government bonds and subsidies. Funds go directly to small business 
development, mortgage and personal loans, and educational efforts. 



Rudolf Steiner Foundation (RSF) Social 

Finance 

 

Narrative: RSF Social Finance (RSF) is a pioneer Social Finance 
organization dedicated to transforming the way the world works with 
money. Their target areas are sustainable agriculture, education and the 
arts, and the environment. RSF offers a range of financial products and 
services, from $500 seed fund donations to 5 million dollar loans and 
capital lines of credit. The organization stands out among Social Finance 
organizations for their integration of Investing, lending, and giving 
within a single nonprofit. RSF Social Finance also hosts and sponsors 
educational events and initiates various forms of dialogue around money 
and transparency. 

Type of Organization: Nonprofit 
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Financial Vehicle(s): PRI, Loan Program, Grantmaking, Donor 
Advised Funds 

Type of Funding Offered: Debt, Donations 

Type of Funding Received: Debt, mezzanine capital (warrants, notes 
royalty streams), donations 

Minimum Investment: Minimum donation for Donor Advised Fund 
is $5,000. Minimum gift awarded by RSF Seed Fund is $500. Loans 
offered by RSF range from $200,000 to $5 million. 

Maximum Investment: None 

Risk: Investors take on risk. Loan repayment history is 100% so risk is 
low. 

Collateral: Provided by borrowers 

Sphere of Origin of Funds: Economic 

Sphere of Destination of Funds: Economic, Political/Rights, and 
Cultural 

Money Flow: There are various and complex money flow circuits 
around RSF. Basically though, investors place financial resources with 
RSF and RSF administers them, providing loans, gifts and other forms 
of investment to for-profit and nonprofit enterprises. 

Three Spheres of Society: 

Economic, Political/Rights, 

and Cultural 
This threefold articulation of society has its origins with the Austrian-
born philosopher and educator Rudolf Steiner (b. 1861 – d. 1925), but is 



increasingly referenced in contemporary innovative social thought. For 
instance, David Korten, Founder of YES! Magazine, recently wrote about 
rebuilding the economy by starting new economic initiatives, redefining 
our cultural narratives, and changing the rules (or laws) around how we 
do economics (Source: D. Korten, YES Magazine Blog, 2011). 

According to Steiner’s original articulation, the Economic Sphere has 
everything to do with how we meet one another’s needs in society – 
through the cycle of production, distribution and consumption. The 
Political/Rights Sphere has everything to do with how we live together in 
a peaceful and equitable way within society – through the laws, 
agreements and political structures we create. And the Cultural Sphere 
has everything to do with how we nurture and develop human capacities 
– both mental and physical – as individuals and within society (Source: 
R. Steiner, The Social Future, 1919). 

So, education, science, art, and religion are all examples of cultural 
phenomena because they develop and nurture human capacities. 
Governance – as far as it involves the making of laws that protect human 
rights, democracy, and civility are examples of political/rights 
phenomena because they all have to do with making society more 
peaceful and equitable. And finance, manufacturing, trade, and 
consumption are all economic phenomena because they have to do with 
meeting human needs. 

This document references the three spheres (Economic, Political/Rights, 
Cultural) in relationship to which sphere of society funds originate in 
and which sphere they are destined for through the flow of Social 
Finance Capital. Funds, or Capital, or Money, are always circulating 
between the spheres, making it difficult to say exactly where funds 
originated. For instance, the government may offer funding to a 
Community Development Financial Institution (CDFI) or a Social 
Impact Bond (SIB) but that money first came from taxpayers who earned 
their money within the Economic Sphere working at their job. This 
document provides a snapshot of an isolated phenomenon. 

The true origin and ongoing circulation of money is more complex and 
involves all three spheres: It has to become ‘Fiat’ (made into legal tender) 
within our political system; it must have a corresponding value which is 



created, in part, through human intelligence and capacities of refining 
labor (developed within the Cultural Sphere) refining labor and, in part, 
through labor working on ‘land’ or on a ‘nature product’ to create a 
commodity within the Economic Sphere. 

For this snapshot view of Social Finance examples, any funds that were 
not allocated by the government are considered to have their origin in 
the Economic Sphere. Bank deposits, private investments, and personal 
donations all come from the economic sphere because they were earned 
at some point, directly or indirectly through production, distribution (or 
trade), and consumption. 

Only two of the Social Finance practices mentioned in this document rely 
on government funding: Social Impact Bonds and Community 
Development Investment. 

Funds going to support education, art, science, research, social work, and 
assessment are considered to be destined for the Cultural Sphere. This is 
the case with Kickstarter, RSF Social Finance, Alternatives Federal 
Credit Union, and Social Finance US. Assessment, as in the example of 
Social Finance US, is included in the Cultural Sphere because it relies on 
the capacity of judgment and concerns itself with human development – 
i.e. whether or not the clients of the nonprofit in question have 
progressed inwardly and outwardly through the service provided. 

Social work, or charity, is hard to place. On the one hand it belongs in the 
Political/Rights Sphere because it raises human beings up to a more 
equitable and dignified place in society and helps them secure their 
rights. On the other hand it belongs in the Cultural Sphere because it 
relies on the ‘healing arts’ of the care providers, which help to nurture 
and educate their clients. In recognition of this dichotomy, the 
administration of the service has been placed in the Cultural Sphere and 
the receiving of the service in the Political/Rights Sphere. 

Funds going directly to government through Treasury Bonds or taxes, for 
example, as well as funds going to support the clients of nonprofit 
charities are considered destined for the Political/Rights Sphere. This is 
the case with Alternatives Credit Union, LION, No Small Potatoes 
Investment Club, and Kickstarter. 



The Threefold Nature of Social Issues 

It is not always so straightforward. Social issues are complex; and in our 
current social system the three spheres are often entangled in unhealthy 
ways. Take homelessness, for example. Is this a political/rights issue, a 
cultural issue, or an economic issue? In some ways, it involves all three 
spheres. It is an economic issue in that it has to do with whether or not a 
person can afford a place to live; it is a political/rights issue in that it has 
to do with how we organize our society in a more or less equitable way; 
and it is a cultural issue in that it has to do with the person’s biography, 
the social or cultural environment he/she comes from, and whether or 
not we, as members of society, through our self development, feel 
inclined to care for our fellow human beings. 

Most big issues have roots in all three spheres, but one can usually tell 
where the primary root is. Issues like homelessness, poverty, and 
joblessness, for instance, appear to have their primary root in 
political/rights life. The main function of this sphere is to maintain 
fairness and equity. That there are some people in society that cannot get 
a job, do not have enough money to live, or lack a home appeals to our 
sense of fairness and human dignity. In a healthy society, these issues are 
addressed in the political system and made the concern of each and every 
citizen. Once they are recognized in the political/rights life, then it 
becomes the responsibility of economic and cultural life to align itself 
accordingly and administer the appropriate services. 

Today, however, the mandate does not always come from government. 
Virtually all of the institutions cited in this document take on a social 
mission of their own accord and only a few receive government funds for 
their work. Among these examples, certain institutions focus on issues of 
equity (equality) more directly. Kiva, Alternatives Credit Union, Social 
Finance US, Create Jobs for USA, and RSF Social Finance all designate 
funds to charitable causes such as alleviating poverty and providing 
housing and jobs to underserved communities. Their means are 
economic (loans, grants, etc) but the ‘ends’ or outcome they affect is 
rights-oriented – i.e. an improved, more fair and equitable standard of 
living, 



The Ninefold Social Organism 

Looking deeper into social life, it becomes apparent that there is a 
threefoldness within each of the three spheres of society. There is a 
culture to economics and politics, economics to culture and politics, and 
politics, governance, legal, or rights concerns in economics and cultural 
life. Colloquially, we speak of ‘consumer culture’ or ‘business culture’ 
when referring to certain behavior and practices within the economy. 
The culture of a car manufacturing company might be blue collar, rough 
around the edges, and direct, while the culture of an IT company might 
be progressive, entrepreneurial, and quick to shift. And in politics, the 
way campaigns are run, how candidates present themselves, and how 
rhetoric is used in debate is all reflective of a certain political culture. 

Looking at economics in politics and culture, one could note how 
schools, churches, political campaigns and government programs are 
financed. And finally, looking at politics, governance, legal, or rights 
concerns in economics and culture one notes how institutions are 
governed, how consumer and employee rights are acknowledged, and 
what laws are upheld in different cultures. This just begins to give a 
sketch of how the three spheres intersect with one another and co-exist 
within a single sphere. 

Together the three spheres make a whole. In any society, organization, or 
group founded by human individuals, regardless of whether the primary 
function is cultural, economic, or political, all three spheres find 
expression. The expression will, of course, look different in quality and 
magnitude depending on the main purpose of that group or organization. 
The examples cited in this document embody how an organization can 
work through primarily economic means to affect not only the economy 
but also culture and political/rights life. By choosing to include ‘people’ 
and the ‘planet’ in addition to financial profit in their value sets, such 
companies change the culture of the Economic Sphere – the way we 
think about doing business; and, they change the standard of living and 
the health of the planet, thus affecting the Political/Rights Sphere.  In 
the drawings, this accounts for placement of organizations on the 
overlapping lines between spheres. 



Each of the three spheres finds its truest expression, however, when it is 
on its own, autonomous from the others; however, that is not to say that 
the three should not come together in organizations or groups. There is 
both healthy and unhealthy overlap. An economic organization without 
culture or rights obligations would be soulless and inhumane. When 
business interests control politics and education it is democracy and 
human development that suffer.  Yet, knowledge and skill developed 
through education in the cultural sphere can only find useful application 
in the spheres of economy and politics. 

In a healthy society, each of the three spheres come to expression 
autonomously and in relationship to the others, and each sphere finds 
ample and balanced expression within the whole of society. 
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